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“And now abideth faith, hope, charity, these 

three; but the greatest of these is charity.” 

I Corinthians 13:13 

God’s  Simple  Plan  of  Salvation 

    First, we must realize that we’ve all sinned. 
Romans 3:23 says, “For all have sinned, and come short of 
the glory of God.” 

    Second, the penalty for our sins is death and eternal 
separation from God. The Bible says in Roman 6:23, “For 
the wages of sin is death.” and in Ezekiel 18:20, “The soul 
that sinneth, it shall die.” 

    Third, Jesus paid our penalty for us. God sent His Son to 
suffer and die in our place on the Cross. 
Romans 5:8 says, But God commended [showed] His love 
toward us, in that, while we were yet sinners, Christ died 
for us.” He died, but three days later rose from the grave 
and is alive forevermore. 

     Fourth, God loves you and wants to save you from your 
sins.  “For God so loved the world, that He gave His only 
begotten Son, that whosoever believeth in Him should not 
perish, but have everlasting life.” John 3:16 

    However, each person must accept Christ personally to 
be saved from their own sins. Jesus said, “I am the way, 
the truth, and the life: No man cometh unto the Father, but 
by me.” John 14:6 “Neither is there salvation in any other: 
for there is none other name under heaven given among 
men, whereby we must be saved.” Acts 4:12 

     There is NO other way. Salvation is not through being 
good, keeping a moral code, being religious, or any other 
efforts of our own. Salvation is only through the Lord Jesus 
Christ. Only His blood can wash away our sins. (See 
Romans 5:9; Ephesians 1:7) We must repent and turn to 
God for salvation – “I tell you, Nay; but, except ye repent, 
ye shall all likewise perish.” Luke 13:3 

     How can you accept Christ as your Saviour? 
Romans 10:13 tells us, “For whosoever shall call upon the 
Name of the Lord shall be saved.” John 1:12 says, “But as 
many as received Him, to them gave He power to become 
the sons of God, even to them that believe on His Name.” 

     Pray, believing from your heart, receiving the Lord as 
your Saviour: “Lord I admit that I am a sinner and deserve 
Your punishment in hell.  Forgive me for my sins – I repent. 
I now trust Jesus Christ as my personal Saviour and call 
upon Him to save me from my sins. I believe that He died 
for me on the Cross and only His blood can wash away my 
sins. I ask for Your gift of Eternal Life, in Jesus Name, 
Amen!” 

God’s Ministries 

Charity Baptist has many opportunities 

to present the Gospel Message to a 

diverse, dense, and financially stricken 

community of Buffalo. We would like to 

share and ask your earnest prayers for 

many souls to turn and accept Christ 

Jesus as their Lord and Saviour on the 

mission field. 

 

 

Ministries We Provide 

 Establishing Street Work in 

Inner Cities 

 Tract Distribution 

 Door to Door Soul-Winning 

 Mission Service 

 Discipleship Program 

 Rehabilitation Classes 

 Clothing Hand-outs 

 Care Packages 

 



 
 

 

 

Our Statement of Doctrine 

We believe: 

 That the Bible is the Word of God and 

final authority, the King James Bible 1611 

 The trinity of the Godhead; Father, Son, 

and Holy Ghost. 

 Creation of man by the direct act of God 

 The fall of man and his need for 

redemption. 

 The deity, incarnation and virgin birth of 

our Lord and Saviour Jesus Christ. 

 Christ’s vicarious atonement for the sins of 

mankind by the shedding of His blood on 

the cross. 

 Christ’s bodily resurrection from the grave 

and His ascension into heaven. 

 In Jesus Christ’s personal, imminent 

return. 

 The justification of the believer by grace 

through faith. 

 In a literal devil who is our adversary. 

 In a literal heaven for the saved and a 

literal hell for the lost. 

 In the local church for the perfecting of the 

saints for the ministry. 

 In the great commission. (Mat. 28:18-20 KJV) 

 

Our History 

In the early 1990’s, a few men and myself 

started evangelizing the streets of Buffalo 

passing out gospel tracts, street preaching and 

visiting door to door in search of sinners in 

need of our Lord Jesus Christ as Saviour. Our 

burden was to work diligently in the most sin 

stricken areas with gang activity, drug dealing 

and high crime violence in the city. 

As we saw the need grow greater, the Lord 

moved me to start Charity Mission, a ministry 

striving to share the gospel to the hopeless 

sinner and a place of refuge in Christ Jesus. 

Charity Mission was not only a ministry 

focused on seeing sinners come to repentance 

and be saved, but a place to see a life restored. 

Our service that we have every week on 

Tuesdays has like-minded churches that 

preach the pure Word of God (KJV 1611) and 

help in ways with a food, clothing and bread 

pantry offered each week. 

The Lord has been so good to us over the 

years seeing His ministry grow. The Lord has 

blessed us with a building recently, located on 

350 Austin Street in Buffalo. This blessing is 

where we can do so much more for the Lord 

in such a diverse and multicultural city that is 

lost and without God. Please pray for us with 

all that He has provided we can further the 

gospel message throughout our mission field 

the inner-city of Buffalo. 

 

Purpose 

Charity Baptist Ministry is here: 

…to see souls saved through the glorious 

Gospel and begin a new life in the Lord Jesus 

Christ. 

…to help individuals, marriages, and families 

repent of a life-style of sin and surrender to a 

life of submission to God. 

…to teach that this is only possible through 

faith in the Word of God. 

Our Vision 
Charity Mission has a strong Gospel-minded 

ministry that is Biblically sound and founded on 

the fundamentals of our faith. This ministry is 

operated through the local church and based on 

the principles and truth of the Word of God 

(KJV 1611). 

I believe we can be an influence on the city of 

Buffalo and to other churches with the Biblical 

truth that the down-and-out in the community, 

ridden with sin can still be saved through the 

glorious gospel. 

 

 

 

 

 

Schedule of Services 

 

Tuesday 7:00 PM - Rescue Mission Service 

Saturday 10:00 AM - Homeless Helping Hand 

 

Charity Mission 

This is the ministry which is the heart of Charity 

Baptist Ministries. The ministry all began on the 

streets of Buffalo many years ago where we not 

only preached at many corners but also worked 

the streets looking under bridges, hiding places 

and safe areas where most homeless persons 

would go for shelter. 

Charity Mission’s focus is first and foremost to 

deliver the glorious gospel to all of them. One 

way is to invite them to a service like this one 

where most churches won’t even allow them in a 

church. This is a place where we can show the 

love of Christ to their lost soul with some food, 

clothing, and a place to begin to hear how to be 

saved through our Lord Jesus Christ. 


